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QUESTION 1

By design, dialog messages interrupt the user and force them to make a decision. 

Which three dialog message components are available in Redwood? (Choose three.) 

A. oj-sp-message-dialog-destructive 

B. oj-sp-messages-banner 

C. oj-sp-message-dialog-general 

D. oj-sp-smart-search-page 

E. oj-sp-message-unsaved-changes 

F. oj-sp-message-banner-unsaved-changes 

Correct Answer: ACE 

This question tests your knowledge of the dialog message components that are available in Redwood, which are used
to interrupt the user and force them to make a decision. The correct answer is A, C, and E, because these are the three
dialog message components that are available in Redwood. The other options are incorrect, becausethey are not dialog
message components, but banner message components or page templates that can be used in different contexts. Here
is a brief description of each dialog message component: oj-sp-message-dialog-destructive: This component is used to
display a dialog message that warns the user about an irreversible action that will delete or destroy data. It has a red
header with an icon and a title, a body with a message and an 

optional description, and two buttons for canceling or confirming the action. oj-sp-message-dialog-general: This
component is used to display a dialog message that informs the user about an action that requires their confirmation or
input. It 

has a blue header with an icon and a title, a body with a message and an optional description or input field, and one or
more buttons for canceling or completing the action. 

oj-sp-message-unsaved-changes: This component is used to display a dialog message that alerts the user about
unsaved changes that will be lost if they navigate away from the current page. It has a yellow header with an icon and a
title, a 

body with a message and an optional description, and two buttons for discarding or saving the changes. 

References: [Redwood Dialog Messages], [oj-sp-message-dialog-destructive], [oj-sp- message-dialog-general], [oj-sp-
message-unsaved-changes] 

 

QUESTION 2

You are designing the UI to display information about a product and are asked to use the card layout, such that: 

?The card layout summarizes the available information about a product in a visually compact manner. 

?The card layout is used as an entry point from where users can access additional details. 

Which card layout is suitable for the above requirements? 
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A. Object Card 

B. Mini Card 

C. mage Card 

D. Scoreboard 

Correct Answer: A 

The Object Card layout is suitable for displaying information about a product and using it as an entry point from where
users can access additional details. The Object Card layout consists of a header with an icon and a title, a body with
one or more fields or actions, and a footer with optional actions or indicators. The Object Card layout summarizes the
available information about a product in a visually compact manner and allows users to perform actions on it or navigate
to more details. Therefore, option A is the correct answer. References: [Object Card Layout], [oj-sp-object-card] 

 

QUESTION 3

What is the correct sequence of steps to understand a problem while designing the Redwood Reference Application? 

A. Understand the problem, write user goals, describe the shape of data of your use case, gather feedback from product
management and other stakeholders, and iterate until you achieve clarity. 

B. Write user goals, describe the shape of data of your use case, understand the problem, gather feedback from product
management and other stakeholders, and iterate until you achieve clarity. 

C. Gather feedback from product management and other stakeholders, write user goals, describe the shape of data of
your use case, understand the problem, and iterate until you achieve clarity. 

D. Describe the shape of data of your use case, gather feedback from product management and other stakeholders,
write user goals, understand the problem, and iterate until you achieve clarity. 

Correct Answer: A 

The correct sequence of steps to understand a problem while designing the Redwood Reference Application is to
understand the problem, write user goals, describe the shape of data of your use case, gather feedback from product
management and other stakeholders, and iterate until you achieve clarity. This is the recommended process for problem
definition in the Redwood design system, as it helps you to align your design with the user needs, business objectives,
and technical constraints. References: : Problem Definition in Redwood Design System 

 

QUESTION 4

While using the Simple Create and Edit Page Template Pattern, which dynamic component can be used in the "main"
slot? 

A. Dynamic Form 

B. Dynamic Container 

C. Dynamic Table 

D. Dynamic Section Binding E. Dynamic Field Binding 
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Correct Answer: A 

The dynamic component that can be used in the "main" slot of the Simple Create and Edit Page Template Pattern is
Dynamic Form. This component allows you to create forms that are bound to data sources and can be configured as
create 

or edit forms. You can use Dynamic Form to display and edit fields from your data source in a simple and consistent
way. 

References: : Simple Create and Edit Page Template Pattern in Redwood Pattern Book : 

Dynamic Form Component in Visual Builder 

 

QUESTION 5

You need to create a customer-facing portal to list products from Fusion Apps. 

What can you use to achieve this? 

A. A stand-alone Visual Builder instance hosting the agg 

B. An Oracle APEX agg that is installed in the Fusion Cloud Apps database 

C. An AgpJJI extension that has a vanity URL setup 

Correct Answer: A 

The best option to create a customer-facing portal to list products from Fusion Apps is to use a stand-alone Visual
Builder instance hosting the app. This way, you can leverage the Redwood design system and components to create a
consistent and engaging user interface for your portal. You can also use Visual Builder\\'s REST capabilities to access
and manipulate data from Fusion Apps services. References: : Visual Builder Overview : Accessing REST Services in
Visual Builder 
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